



# BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: Warren Consolidated Schools  
Classroom AV Systems

IDS Project No.: 16210-1000 BP-T5

Date: February 20, 2018

**Bid Bond**

**Familiar Disclosure**

**Iran Economic Sanctions Act**

**BASE BID NO. 1 – CLASSROOM AV SYSTEMS (BEER MIDDLE SCHOOL, CARLETON MIDDLE SCHOOL, CARTER MIDDLE SCHOOL, FLYNN EDUCATIONAL CENTER, GRISSOM MIDDLE SCHOOL, COUSINO HIGH SCHOOL, STERLING HEIGHTS HIGH SCHOOL, WARREN MOTT HIGH SCHOOL, CAREER PREPARATION CENTER, ADMINISTRATION BUILDING AND THE BUTCHER COMMUNITY CENTER)**

**Mandatory Alternate No.1**

**Mandatory Alternate No.2**

**Voluntary Alternate No.1**

**Voluntary Alternate No.2**

**Voluntary Alternate No.3**

**Voluntary Alternate No.4**

**Voluntary Alternate No.5**

**Voluntary Alternate No.6**

**Addendum No. 1-3 Included**

**Unit Pricing Included**

VSC	Tierney Brothers	Sehi Computer Products	SoundCom Systems	Presidio	Digital Age Technologies
					Y
					Y
					Y
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Non-Compliant	No Bid	\$3,079,598.00
					(\$104,545.00)
					\$602,690.00
					\$0.00
					-
					\$3,568,937.16
					(\$33,530.00)
					Deduct 2% if awarded BB-1,2,3
					Deduct 3% if awarded BB-1,2,3,4
					Y
					Y

**Bid Bond**

**Familiar Disclosure**

**Iran Economic Sanctions Act**

**BASE BID NO. 2 – CLASSROOM AV SYSTEMS (ANGUS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, BLACK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, CROMIE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, GREEN ACRES ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, HARWOOD ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, HATHERLY EDUCATIONAL CENTER, HOLDEN ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, JEFFERSON ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, LEAN ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, SIERSMA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, SUSICK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, WILDE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL, WILKERSON ELEMENTARY SCHOOL AND WILLOW WOODS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL)**

**Mandatory Alternate No.1**

**Mandatory Alternate No.2**

**Voluntary Alternate No.1**

**Voluntary Alternate No.2**

					Y
					Y
					Y
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Non-Compliant	No Bid	\$1,670,230.00
					(\$98,454.00)
					\$528,843.00
					\$0.00
					-

248-823-2100  
www.ids-troy.com  
1441 w. long lake road, ste. 200  
troy, mi 48098  
INTEGRATED **design** SOLUTIONS  
architecture engineering interiors & technology

Voluntary Alternate No.3					\$2,148,597.16
Voluntary Alternate No.4					(\$23,520.00)
Voluntary Alternate No.5					See BB-1, VA#5
Voluntary Alternate No.6					See BB-1, VA#6
Addendum No. 1-3 Included					Y
Unit Pricing Included					Y

Bid Bond	Y	Y	Y		Y	
Familiar Disclosure	Y	Y	Y		Y	
Iran Economic Sanctions Act	Y	Y	Y		Y	
BASE BID NO. 3 - INTERACTIVE DISPLAYS	\$1,845,647.00	\$2,592,714.89	\$1,723,521.00	Non-Compliant	\$2,275,306.00	Non-Compliant
Mandatory Alternate No.1	\$970,722.00	\$810,409.78	\$1,341,600.00		\$1,787,327.00	
Mandatory Alternate No.2	\$594,612.00	No Change	\$1,521,000.00		\$2,562,324.00	
Mandatory Alternate No.3	\$1,372,702.00	\$810,409.78	\$951,600.00		\$4,110,351.00	
Voluntary Alternate No.1	\$34,601.00	(\$847,217.06)	\$3,850.00		\$0.00	
Voluntary Alternate No.2	\$187,528.00	(\$484,162.07)	-		-	
Voluntary Alternate No.3	\$519.00 ea	-	-		-	
Voluntary Alternate No.4	\$485.00 ea	-	-		-	
Voluntary Alternate No.5	\$780.00 ea	-	-		-	
Voluntary Alternate No.6	\$90,000.00	-	-		-	
Addendum No. 1-3 Included	1 & 2	Y	Y		1	
Unit Pricing Included	Y	Y	Y		Y	

Bid Bond					Y	Y
Familiar Disclosure					Y	Y
Iran Economic Sanctions Act					Y	Y
BASE BID NO. 4 - CISCO SPARK EQUIPMENT AND LICENSING	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$352,281.75	\$226,885.00
Mandatory Alternate No.1					\$193,162.00	\$212,645.00
Mandatory Alternate No.2					\$4,696.00	\$5,000.00
Voluntary Alternate No.1					\$20,046.80	\$27,500.00
Voluntary Alternate No.2					\$80,870.50	-
Voluntary Alternate No.3					\$80,870.50	-
Voluntary Alternate No.4					\$80,870.50	-
Voluntary Alternate No.5					\$80,870.50	-
Voluntary Alternate No.6					\$80,870.50	See BB-1, VA#6
Addendum No. 1-3 Included					1	Y
Unit Pricing Included					Y	Y